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The Board is committed to developing goals that measure the ongoing condition of the 
District’s operational environment.  The Board regularly assesses the District’s 
institutional effectiveness.      
      
The Chancellor shall ensure that the Grossmont-Cuyamaca Community College District 
Office (District) and Colleges within the District have and implement a broad-based, 
comprehensive, systematic, and integrated system of planning that involves appropriate 
segments of the District Office and Colleges. This planning and evaluation system shall 
be guided by the vision and mission of the District and Colleges and supported by 
institutional effectiveness research. 

 
The comprehensive integrated planning system shall include plans required by Title 5, 
as well as those that are relevant to the District and Colleges' educational, strategic, and 
resource planning. A master list of these plans shall be maintained in the District Office 
and updated as needed.  

 
The Chancellor shall ensure that institutional plans contain goals, objectives and 
measurable outcomes, are integrated into the annual budget process, and that the 
results of institutional planning are broadly communicated. 

 
The Board is committed to developing goals that measure the ongoing condition of the 
District’s operational environment.  The Board regularly assesses the District’s 
institutional effectiveness, including the assessment of goals and objectives with respect 
to the District’s commitment to diversity, equity and inclusion to the fullest extent 
permitted by law. 

 
The Chancellor shall submit to the Governing Board those plans for which Board 
approval is required by Title 5. 
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The Chancellor shall inform the Governing Board about the status of planning and 
institutional progress toward goals, objectives, and outcomes identified within planning 
documents. 

 
The Chancellor shall ensure the Governing Board has an opportunity to assist in 
developing the general institutional mission and goals as needed in order to inform the 
comprehensive system of planning. 
 

 


