



**BID RESULTS: B12.006 - PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF CARDIAC ULTRASOUND SYSTEM (REFURBISHED)**

**BID OPENING: May 14, 2012, 2:00 P.M.**

LN #		QTY	DESCRIPTION	Vendor: <b>A-1 MEDICAL</b>	Vendor <b>ORANGE COUNTY MEDICAL</b>	Vendor: <b>ABSOLUTE MEDICAL</b>	Vendor: <b>UNIVERSAL DIAG</b>	Vendor: <b>PHILIPS MEDICAL</b>					
				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE				
1	1		Cardiac Ultrasound System (reburbished)	\$ 83,502.00	\$ 83,502.00	\$91,725.00	\$ 91,725.00	\$ 92,550.00	\$ 92,550.00	\$ 96,750.00	\$ 96,750.00	\$ 106,288.00	\$ 106,288.00
<b>TOTALS</b>				<b>\$ 83,502.00</b>	<b>\$ 83,502.00</b>	<b>\$ 91,725.00</b>	<b>\$ 91,725.00</b>	<b>\$ 92,550.00</b>	<b>\$ 92,550.00</b>	<b>\$ 96,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 96,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 106,288.00</b>	<b>\$ 106,288.00</b>
				Did not acknowledge Addenda 1,	No Seal, Pg 13	Did not acknowledge Addenda 1,	No Seal, Pg 13	Did not acknowledge Addenda 1,	No Seal, Pg 13	Did not acknowledge Addenda 1,	No Seal, Pg 13	Did not acknowledge Addenda 1,	No Seal, Pg 13

LN #		QTY	DESCRIPTION	Vendor: <b>MEDICAL SUPPLIES</b>	Vendor: <b>AKW MEDICAL</b>	Vendor: <b>MCKESSON</b>	Vendor: <b>LYNN</b>	Vendor: <b>PROVIDIAN MEDICAL</b>	
				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	1		Cardiac Ultrasound System (reburbished)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
<b>TOTALS</b>				<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>

LN #		QTY	DESCRIPTION	Vendor: <b>PHYSICIAN S&amp;S</b>	Vendor: <b>DRE INC</b>	Vendor: <b>MED.RESOURCES</b>	Vendor: <b>MEDICAL DEVICE</b>	Vendor: <b>ACCURATE</b>	Vendor: <b>AMBASSADOR</b>
				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	1		Cardiac Ultrasound System (reburbished)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
<b>TOTALS</b>				<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>

- ◆ Bid B12.006 - Purchase and Installation of ULTRASOUND SYSTEM (REFURBISHED) was advertised 04/13/12 and 04/20/12 in San Diego Daily Transcript as well it was posted on the GCCCD website.
- ◆ Bid packets were mailed to the following (16) vendors: Med. Resources (CA), Medical Supplies (TX), Ambassador Medical (IN), Absolute Medical (NY), Providian Medical (OH), Phillips Medical (WA), Orange County Medical (CA), AKW Medical (CA), MeKesson (CA), Lynn Medical (MI), Universal Diagnostics (CA), Accurate Medical (CA), Physician Sales (CA), DRE Inc (KY), A1 Medical (CA) and Medical Device (MD).
- ◆ Five (5) bids were received by the bid opening deadline of 05/14/12, 2:00 p.m. The following (5) vendors submitted bids: Absolute Medical (NY), Philips Medical (WA), Orange County Med. Sales (CA), Universal Diagnostics (CA) and A-1 Medical (CA).
- ◆ The lowest responsive bidder was A-1 Medical Equipment & Supply, at \$83,502. inclusive of the bid lot, equipment specs as "equal to" and addendum requirements.
- ◆ RECOMMENDATION: It is recommended the bid be awarded to A1 Medical Equipment & Supply, Inc., with an estimated bid award total of \$ 83,502.00.