

B17.042 GROSSMONT COLLEGE DIGITAL MEDIA COMMUNICATIONS UPGRADES PHASE II

RESUME

Bid Opening: October 3, 2017 at 2:00 p.m.

Item No.	Description	Audio Associates of San Diego	AVI Systems Inc	Construct Connect	Pacific Design & Integration Inc	**Southland Technology	Spinitar	Troxell
1	Monitor, rack mount, dual 7", waveform and vectorscope. Marshall Electronics OR-702.	\$702.16	\$3,369.32	No Bid	\$3,563.19	\$3,222.00	\$3,529.76	\$3,241.94
2	Monitor, rack mount, 17" with 3GSDI input and loop through. Marshall Electronics V-LCD17HR-3G-DT.	\$1,350.61	\$876.14	No Bid	\$1,243.81	\$1,125.00	\$1,232.14	\$1,166.67
3	Radio production console, modular, with 15 input modules. Arrakis MARC-15-15.	\$8,251.82	\$7,062.75	No Bid	\$7,065.28	\$7,913.00	\$8,332.14	\$6,573.86
4	Converter, video input HDMI with embedded audio. Aja HA5-PLUS.	\$412.65	\$336.65	No Bid	\$356.02	\$389.00	\$414.92	\$377.56
5	Converter, video input SD/HD-SDI w/embedded audio. Aja HD10CEA.	\$727.05	\$592.33	No Bid	\$626.00	\$629.00	\$713.26	\$764.43
6	Amplifier/repeater, distribution, 1x4 HD-SDI/SDI. Aja HD5DA.	\$204.36	\$166.19	No Bid	\$175.76	\$185.00	\$200.12	\$197.87
7	Monitor, LED, touchscreen, 1920x1080 full HD. Viewsonic TD2220.	\$316.54	\$279.55	No Bid	\$290.37	\$309.00	\$322.24	\$267.35
8	Camera, POV, multi-purpose HDTV box type. Hitachi DK-Z50.	\$13,270.30	\$12,500.00	No Bid	\$11,440.66	\$10,549.00	\$19,014.29	\$17,204.25
9	Operation panel, compact, remote. Hitachi RU-1000VR.	\$1,801.25	\$1,718.75	No Bid	\$1,652.41	\$1,549.00	\$1,800.00	\$1,636.76
10	Cable, remote control, 100 ft. Hitachi C-302-RC2.	\$315.71	\$265.10	No Bid	\$289.62	\$260.00	\$315.60	\$299.24
11	Audio player, standalone stereo button box. Hotshot 2-Stereo.	\$5,496.76	\$3,453.56	No Bid	\$4,081.14	\$4,409.00	\$3,698.42	\$3,306.14

Item No.	Description	Audio Associates of San Diego	AVI Systems Inc	Construct Connect	Pacific Design & Integration Inc	**Southland Technology	Spinitar	Troxell
12	Camera control panel, robotic, controls via flexible transmission devices. Telemetrics RCCP-1.	\$11,691.75	\$9,545.45	No Bid	\$10,094.70	\$9,918.00	\$10,625.00	\$9,620.17
13	Pan/tilt head, camera/lens interface cable. Telemetrics PT-CP-S4 BUNDLE.	\$1,573.97	\$19,604.55	No Bid	\$20,732.59	\$9,950.00	\$21,821.73	\$19,820.27
14	Elevating pedestal, head option, telepod tripod legs and power supply. Telemetrics ETP BUNDLE.	\$24,012.63	Included in item 13	No Bid	Included in item 13	\$11,191.00	Included in item 13	Included in item 13
15	Remote control lens, without extender. Fujinon XA20sx8.5BMD.	\$8,272.65	\$5,650.00	No Bid	\$7,234.54	\$6,663.00	Included	Included in item 8
16	Studio dolly, with adjustable cable guards. Miller 481.	\$1,553.40	\$1,346.59	No Bid	\$1,443.91	\$1,375.00	\$1,485.96	\$1,294.23
	Subtotal of equipment	\$79,953.61	\$66,766.93	No Bid	\$70,290.00	\$69,636.00	\$73,505.58	\$65,770.74
	Installation of equipment	\$16,569.50	\$14,230.86	No Bid	\$17,088.00	\$9,400.00	\$64,660.00	\$31,182.80
	One year warranty of equipment	\$1.00	\$1,800.00	No Bid	Included	\$580.00	\$3,500.00	Included
	Grand total	\$96,524.11	\$82,797.79	No Bid	\$87,378.00	\$79,616.00	\$141,665.58	\$96,953.54

Bids were sent to: Western Audio Visual, Pacific Design & Integration, Inc., CompView Audio Visual, Troxell Communications, Inc., Spinitar, Southland Technology, Inc., Audio Associates of San Diego, Associated Telecom, Inc., Avoico, Inc., Business Telecommunication Systems, Inc., Columbia Pacific Telesystems, Communication Wiring Specialists, Inc., Day Wireless Systems, Enhanced Voice & Data Networks, Intec Network Solutions, Inc., Kotcher Communications, LANtelligence, Inc., McMahon Telecommunications, Inc., Nova Voice & Data Systems, Inc., PhoneAll, Inc., Semper Fi Voice & Data Systems, Technical Telephone Services, Inc., Telcom Data LLC, Telephone Jacks, Trucomm SBS, Inc., VT Milcom Systems, West Coast Cabling, Inc., My Office, Inc., Professional Telecommunications Services, Inc., AVI Systems, Inc., Digital Networks Group, Inc., Construct Connect, Education Intelligence Inc., Associated General Contractors of America, AVI-SPL, Lightwerks Communication Systems, Inc., NEC Corporation of America, DTC, Tel/Com/Tec and Videotape Products.

Recommended Award: AVI Systems, Inc

** = Nonresponsive as contractor's license expired on September 30, 2017.